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Search Ty pe : VEHICLE

Year : 2004

Make : MAZDA

Model : RX-8

NHTSA Action Number:       NHTSA Recall Campaign Number:    

     PE09045    N/A

Make:    MAZDA    Model:    RX-8

Manufacturer : MAZDA MOTOR CORP

Year : 2004

Component :
 POWER TRAIN:CLUTCH ASSEMBLY:PEDAL/LINKAGE
  POWER TRAIN:MANUAL TRANSMISSION
 

Date Investigation Opened : September 23, 2009

Date Investigation Closed : August 19, 2010

Summary:

 On September 23, 2009, the Of f ice of  Def ects Inv estigation (ODI) opened a Preliminary  Ev aluation to inv estigate
allegations of  the clutch pedal bracket f ailures in MY 2004 - 2006 Mazda RX8 v ehicles. In response to an inf ormation request
letter sent by  ODI, Mazda stated that the f ailure mechanism may  be related to an improper f astener attachment sequence to
the body . The improper sequence may  create a distortion of  the pedal bracket and create a stress amplitude during pedal
usage that may  go bey ond the wear out limit of  the bracket. Mazda stated that the percentages of  v ehicles experiencing the
def ect is low at approximately  1% of  the v ehicle population projected to 10 y ears in serv ice based on analy sis of  warranty
claim data that best represented the alleged def ect. In terms of  risk to motor v ehicle saf ety , Mazda stated that the f ailure is
progressiv e with warning manif ested in noise and dif f iculty  in shif ting gears prior to complete f ailure of  the bracket. Mazda
also stated that when a bracket f racture occurs the clutch pedal may  lean towards the brake pedal howev er gear shif ting
becomes impossible prior to any  contact of  the clutch pedal to the brake pedal. ODI is not aware of  any  crashes associated
with a clutch pedal bracket f ailure in the subject v ehicles. ODI's analy sis of  warranty  claim data prov ided by  Mazda y ielded
f ailure rates of  approximately  3% projected ov er 10 y ears in serv ice. ODI's analy sis of  Vehicle Owner Questionnaire (VOQ)
data complaint indicates that approximately  5% of  the VOQ complainants allege they  were unable to get out of  the roadway
as a result of  a clutch pedal bracket f ailure. None of  these incidents occurred on a highway . Approximately  7% of  the
complainants alleged a contact condition af ter a clutch pedal bracket f ailure of  the clutch pedal to the brake pedal. None of
these complaints noted dif f iculty  in getting the v ehicle stopped. Mazda has inf ormed ODI that it will conducted an Owner
Notif ication of  an extended warranty  cov erage program increasing the clutch pedal assembly  warranty  to 8 y ears and limited
at 100K miles f or model y ears 2004 through 2009 RX8 v ehicles. A saf ety -related def ect trend has not been identif ied at this
time and f urther use of  agency  resources does not appear to be warranted. Accordingly , this inv estigation is closed. The
closing of  this inv estigation does not constitute a f inding by  NHTSA that a saf ety -related def ect does not exist. The agency
will continue to monitor this issue and will take f urther action if  warranted by  the circumstances.


